

2021 - 2022 PAVEMENT MARKING BID RESULTS

	Poirier Guidelines Matthew King (978) 249-7652			Markings, Inc. Monique (781) 826-5171			Atlantic Pavement Marking Marc Stewart (203) 758-0800			On-The-Line, Inc. Al Griffin (207) 947-9912			K5 Corporation Kathy DeLong (781) 982-9229		
	Standard Paint with Glass Beads		Polyurea Paint				Standard Paint with Glass Beads		Polyurea Paint	Standard Paint with Glass Beads		Polyurea Paint	Standard Paint with Glass Beads		Polyurea Paint
BIKE (EACH)	15.00		No Bid	21.50		46.50	15.00		No Bid	12.00		20.00	25.00		75.00
PERSON WALKING (EACH)	25.00		No Bid	29.75		46.50	25.00		No Bid	20.00		40.00	25.00		75.00
6' ONLY - White (EACH)	34.00		No Bid	34.75		78.05	34.00		No Bid	20.00		40.00	32.00		120.00
RAILROAD CROSSING (EACH)	80.00		No Bid	85.00		436.50	72.00		No Bid	175.00		275.00	75.00		375.00
6" MPH (EACH)	45.50		No Bid	35.00		85.00	25.00		No Bid	17.00		34.00	45.00		100.00
BLACK OUT (LN. FT)	1.00		No Bid	.95		N/A	0.90		No Bid	.60		1.20	1.00		1.50
6' AHD (EACH)	25.50		No Bid	42.50		78.10	40.00		No Bid	50.00		100.00	29.00		200.00
2' STOP (EACH)	20.00		No Bid	31.50		45.00	30.00		No Bid	20.00		40.00	20.00		200.00
6' STOP (EACH)	34.00		No Bid	52.50		75.00	50.00		No Bid	55.00		110.00	32.00		200.00
Grade of Paint:	Low Voc Setfast			Maine Spec. -			State of Maine Specs. 2036 & 2037			White/yellow: 982911, 982912 Polyurea Paint: Series 5000 Spec			Low Voc Setfast		
Supplier:	Sherwin-Williams			Franklin Paint			Franklin Paint			White/yellow - Ennis Flint Polyurea - 3M			Franklin Paint		
Comments:															